
 
 
 

 
 

CEB Acquires Leading California Family Law Resource Attorney’s 
BriefCase, Doubling Market Share 

 
OAKLAND, Calif. (February 18, 2025) — CEB, the leading source of California-specific legal research, 
practical guidance and continuing legal education (CLE), has acquired family law resource Attorney’s 
BriefCase Inc., effective today. The deal pairs two of the most trusted and authoritative California legal research 
and CLE providers, solidifying the leadership position of CEB in the family law market. 
 
Founded by the preeminent California family law attorney Garrett Dailey, Attorney’s BriefCase is the oldest 
self-contained legal research program. Its offerings include a comprehensive family law research product and 
the market-leading annual Family Law Seminar CLE series that is widely considered a must-attend for 
California family law attorneys.  
 
“We are honored that Garrett has chosen CEB to help him carry on his life’s work of developing and curating 
the state's most respected family law resource,” said CEB CEO and Executive Director Kelly Lake. “This 
alignment reinforces our position as the No. 1 source of California legal knowledge and information, in addition 
to substantially increasing our family law content and CLE offerings.”  
 
As part of the transaction, Dailey will join CEB as Editor Emeritus to ensure product and service continuity. He 
will continue to play a large part in the curriculum and delivery of annual CLE seminars. The core Attorney’s 
BriefCase team will also support the integration with CEB.  
 
“CEB shares my passion for supporting the California legal market, and this alliance complements my vision 
for the evolution of Attorney’s BriefCase,” said Dailey. “Combined, we will provide the kinds of must-have 
resources that California family lawyers wouldn’t even think about practicing without.”  
 
The acquisition blends the Attorney’s BriefCase curated case law coverage and bench-to-bar CLE collection 
with CEB’s attorney-authored practical guidance, including its popular Practice Under the California Family 
Law Code. Customers of both companies will benefit from this comprehensive resource, now available in one 
collection.  
 
“We are confident that every practicing California family law attorney will find exactly what they need within 
CEB as we combine the exhaustive offerings of Attorney’s BriefCase with our own,” said Geoff Moore, CEB’s 
Small Law Segment Product Manager. “Having Garrett and his team join us will also maintain the personalized 
service Attorney’s BriefCase customers have come to expect, as putting our users first has always been a core 
value for CEB.”  
 

 

 

https://store.ceb.com/products/practice-under-the-california-family-code-dissolution-legal-separation-nullity-1?srsltid=AfmBOorgwNRcmPSqR0uUiRsz2-AFTwXTr8q6UTmR8Xa0vNwAlLHyNAFF
https://store.ceb.com/products/practice-under-the-california-family-code-dissolution-legal-separation-nullity-1?srsltid=AfmBOorgwNRcmPSqR0uUiRsz2-AFTwXTr8q6UTmR8Xa0vNwAlLHyNAFF


 
About CEB 
 
CEB is the leading source of California-specific legal research, practical guidance and continuing education, 
trusted by legal professionals for over 75 years. Our comprehensive content and analysis, developed in 
collaboration with California’s top judges and practicing attorneys, empower law firms, government agencies 
and companies of all sizes to navigate the complexities of California law with accuracy and confidence. From 
authoritative research tools and practical workflows to daily news updates and expert insights, CEB provides 
the solutions that legal teams need to deliver superior client outcomes and respond proactively to the state’s 
evolving legal landscape. For more information, please visit ceb.com.  
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